
$358,000 - 1960 Northern Flicker Court Unit# 7, Kelowna
MLS® #10344583 

$358,000
0 Bedroom, 0.00 Bathroom, 
Vacant Land on 0.15 Acres

Juniper Grove, Kelowna, British Columbia

Build Your Dream Home in McKinley Beach's
Juniper Grove Set against the stunning natural
backdrop of McKinley Beach, this spacious lot
in the sought-after Juniper Grove
neighborhood offers the perfect foundation for
your dream home. Embrace the beauty of
nature while enjoying the comfort and
convenience of being just minutes from city
amenities. Design and build with one of
McKinley Beachâ€™s preferred builders to
create a custom home that reflects your
lifestyleâ€”complete with ample outdoor space
for entertaining, gardening, or simply relaxing. 
 Live in a serene, master-planned community
that blends tranquility with connection. Plus,
enjoy the brand-new Our Place community
centre, now open and ready to welcome you. 
Donâ€™t miss this chance to own a piece of
McKinley Beachâ€”where natural beauty
meets modern living. (id:6289)

Essential Information

Listing # 10344583

Price $358,000

Bathrooms 0.00

Acres 0.15

Type Vacant Land

Sub-Type Strata

Community Information

Address 1960 Northern Flicker Court Unit# 7



Subdivision Juniper Grove

City Kelowna

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V1V0G3

Amenities

Utilities Electricity, Natural Gas, Telephone, Sewer, Water

Is Waterfront Yes

Waterfront Waterfront on pond

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office Sotheby's International Realty Canada
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