
$359,900 - 1665 Ufton Court Unit# #333, Kelowna
MLS® #10361544 

$359,900
2 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 1,229 sqft
Single Family

Tudor Manor, Kelowna, British Columbia

This renovated top floor condo is a true
retreat, perfectly positioned on the quiet side
of a solid concrete building that offers
exceptional soundproofing between units! With
2 bedrooms and 2 bathrooms, it delivers both
comfort and functionality. Step inside to a
spacious, freshly painted living area with an
open concept dining and living space,
complete with a cozy electric fireplace. The
kitchen features updated shaker style
cabinetry, modern appliances, generous
counter space, and even a dedicated coffee
station. The primary bedroom easily
accommodates a king sized bed, with walk
through closets leading to a large ensuite. A
second well sized bedroom is tucked beside
the main 5 piece bathroom. Other highlights
include upgraded laminate flooring, in suite
laundry, ample storage, and secure
underground parking. Enjoy the fully enclosed
sunroom year round, or open it up to create
fresh, airy outdoor space. A new patio door
adds a modern touch and easy access. Low
strata fees and a low maintenance lifestyle
make this home even more attractive. Located
just minutes from Parkinson Rec Centre,
shopping, transit, and more! Itâ€™s the
perfect blend of peace, convenience, and
value. (id:6289)

Built in 1977

Essential Information



Listing # 10361544

Price $359,900

Bedrooms 2

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 1,229

Year Built 1977

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style Other

Community Information

Address 1665 Ufton Court Unit# #333

Subdivision Tudor Manor

City Kelowna

Province British Columbia

Postal Code V1Y8G7

Amenities

Parking Spaces 1

Parking Parkade

Interior

Heating Forced air, See remarks

Cooling Central air conditioning

# of Stories 1

Additional Information

Zoning Unknown

Listing Details

Listing Office Macdonald Realty
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