
$699,000 - 604 South Pacific Avenue, Windsor
MLS® #25023467 

$699,000
4 Bedroom, 3.00 Bathroom, 1,630 sqft
Single Family

N/A, Windsor, Ontario

Welcome to 604 South Pacific Ave! A
beautifully built 2023 Raised Ranch, perfectly
situated at the end of a cul-de-sac in one of
South Windsorâ€™s most convenient
locations. With 2+1 bedrooms, 3 full
bathrooms, 2 full kitchens, and a bonus room,
this home is ideal for multi-generational living
or generating potential rental income. The fully
finished lower level features a private grade
entrance, complete with included kitchen
appliances, washer and dryerâ€”ready for
immediate occupancy or investment use.
Finished stamped driveway with exposed
aggregate. Double car garage comes with a
220V charger cable. Enjoy peace of mind with
a security camera system already installed,
and take advantage of the generous land
space surrounding the property, perfect for
outdoor activities, or future enhancements.
Don't miss this incredible opportunity in a
prime South Windsor location! (id:6289)

Built in 2023

Essential Information

Listing # 25023467

Price $699,000

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 3.00

Square Footage 1,630

Year Built 2023

Type Single Family



Sub-Type Freehold

Style Raised Ranch w/ Bonus Room

Community Information

Address 604 South Pacific Avenue

Subdivision N/A

City Windsor

Province Ontario

Postal Code N8X2W8

Amenities

Features Cul-de-sac, Finished Driveway

Parking Garage

# of Garages 1

Interior

Appliances Central Vacuum, Dryer, Freezer, Refrigerator, Stove, Washer

Heating Natural gas Forced air

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

Fireplaces Gas

Exterior

Exterior Brick, Stone, Concrete/Stucco

Foundation Concrete

Listing Details

Listing Office JUMP REALTY INC.
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