
$599,900 - 3185 Wildwood, Windsor
MLS® #25024220 

$599,900
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 
Single Family

N/A, Windsor, Ontario

Discover your dream home in the heart of
vibrant Forest Glade! This stunning
3-bedroom, 2-bathroom 4-level backsplit
boasts spacious bedrooms, abundant natural
light, and modern updates, including freshly
painted interiors, new landscaping, and
energy-efficient windows and doors (2017).
Enjoy summer days by the heated in-ground
pool (new heater and pump, 2023) with a
removable safety fence and all supplies
included, or fire up the BBQ with the
convenient gas hookup. With central vac,
ample storage, and a prime location on a
major bus route, you're steps from a park,
community centre, library, arena, and tennis
courts, plus a short walk to schools and easy
access to EC Row and major shopping. This
gem in a fantastic neighbourhood is ready to
welcome you home! (id:6289)

Built in 1976

Essential Information

Listing # 25024220

Price $599,900

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Year Built 1976

Type Single Family

Sub-Type Freehold

Style 4 Level



Community Information

Address 3185 Wildwood

Subdivision N/A

City Windsor

Province Ontario

Postal Code N8R1Y1

Amenities

Features Double width or more driveway, Concrete Driveway, Finished Driveway

Parking Carport

# of Garages 1

Has Pool Yes

Pool Inground pool

Interior

Appliances Dryer, Microwave Range Hood Combo, Refrigerator, Stove, Washer

Heating Natural gas Furnace

Cooling Central air conditioning

Fireplace Yes

Fireplaces Gas

Exterior

Exterior Aluminum/Vinyl, Brick

Foundation Concrete
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